
Freedom of Movement and the right of abode for everyone are two sides of the same coin. 
Both claims are directed against a system of repression, restriction and administration of 
human lives. The framework for this system is constituted by an economy which places 
the accumulation of profit over the dignity of every single human being and where the ac-
cumulation of profit can only be achieved via economic growth. This logic does not only 
apply to the external exploitation of nature and workforce, but it reaches humans in all 
their areas of life and in their behavioral patterns as well. Key terms such as pressure to 
perform,perform, self-optimization and separation are just a three of the many examples that 
exist. The concept of the welfare state is failing – not only in the south of Europe – and 
the preservation of state power as well as the justification of state legitimacy  is assured 
by the creation of enemy images which come along with an extension of administrative 
and executive competences by a police apparatus. Stereotyped ideas of gender, racism 
and surveillance are remobilized, in order to control the society. 

Social struggles in the form of insurrections, campaigns, movements and camps critically 
put this into question. They share the focus on social relations, which return human signi-
fication and a creative power back to individuals. In times of abstract work and self-man-
agement, the social cooperation of humans is recaptured in collective spaces in forms of 
insurrections and camps and is lived through self-organization and consensual decision-
making. 

The camp will take place in a self-organized, anti-hierarchical and consensual way. At the 
same time, we take in consideration that also left-winged structures are surrounded by 
borders. Therefore we advocate that the political debate should take place in an “error-
friendly” space. However: racist, sexist, homophobic or other discriminating and insult-
ing behaviour is a no-go!

Let’s work together in order to develop alternatives of solidarity and lets start to live 
them instead of remain only dreaming of a better world and just criticizing the existing 
one! If you already have some ideas for workshops, events, raging concerts, fantastic par-
ties over anything else – great! Start organizing it right now! Otherwise – pack your bag 
with good friends, smart contacts, ideas, sparkling enthusiasm, camping equipment and 
burning hearts.

No Borders !


